Consent Agenda – 05/21/07
Consider motion to approve consent agenda:

Minutes: Approval My 7, 2007 regular  school board minutes 

MINUTES OF THE Regular SCHOOL BOARD MEETING OF THE SCHOOL BOARD OF INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 721 SCOTT, RICE LE SUEUR COUNTIES, NEW PRAGUE, MINNESOTA 56071

  May 7,  2007
6:00 pm.
Central Education Campus  Board  Room
CALL TO ORDER

 Chairperson Bob Reed called the May 7, 2007 regular school board meeting to order at 6:02 pm.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

 Board members rose and recited the Pledge of Allegiance.

ROLL CALL

 Roll was taken with board member Dan Carlson absent

SPECIAL PRESENTATION

 Board member Dvorak read the following proclamation in honor of  National Teachers Week. Swiss Psychiatrist Carl Gustav Jung noted that:  “One looks back with appreciation to the brilliant teachers, but with gratitude to those who touched our human feelings. The curriculum is so much necessary raw material, but warmth is the vital element for the growing plant and for the soul of the child.” Thanks to our many outstanding New Prague Area Teachers during this National Teacher Appreciation Week. New Prague Area Schools Board of Directors, 05/07/2007.  Board member Reed presented information on a donation that has been received by the Middle School of a cow sculpture donated by Andrew Rapp, brother of  Middle School Art Teacher Sarah Rapp.  Introduction of Amy Eich, Community Education Director effective July 1, 2007

OPEN FORUM

Larry Pint addressed the board encouraging board member to proceed with caution when adding a program at the expense of later cuts.  He also expressed concern for the 6:00 pm start date being too early for the public who work out of town being able to attend.

Steve Kehrli approached the board asking for continuation of the planned path for the new soccer program.  The high participation level of students taking soccer through the community ed programs states that there is a definite interest in the program.

APPROVAL OF AGENDA  

A change in the agenda was requested placing the Committee discussion prior to the Action Items due to several items that needed further discussion.  Motion by Havlicek and seconded by Walerius to approve the amended agenda.  Motion carried 6/0.

CONSENT AGENDA
 A motion was made by Beckius and seconded by Dvorak to approve all items on the consent agenda.  Motion carried 6/0.  Upon her retirement, Joyce Bailey was commended for her years of service to the school district.

MOTION FOR BOARD TO ACT AS A COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE

Motion by Fadden and seconded by Dvorak for the board to act as a committee of the whole.  Motion carried 6/0.

COMMITTEE ITEMS

·  Selection of Dental Insurance Program:  Information was given to the board by Mr. Mark Beltz, Health and Dental Insurance Consultant.  The insurance committee of the school district met and have discussed the switch of companies changing from Delta Dental to Health Partners and aligning the benefits and rates between the two groups.  Discussion followed with immediate action requested.   

· Budget 2007/2008:  Finance Director Dan Pyan and Superintendent Rouse have presented the budget to all of the subcommittees and the presentation tonight contains recommendations from those committees and a rebalance of the dollars within the budget.  Current fund balances were presented by department using the same demographic as previous years.  Immediate Action requested on approval of Budget 2007/2008.

· Soccer Budget:  Soccer is moving to JV level for the 2007/2008 school year and is part of  07/08 budget.  Bob Scripture addressed the board stating that he feels that there will be approximately 40 students in grades 9-12 participating in the program next year.  Field status at this time is still questionable.  Games are currently scheduled so there are only five home games and the first five games are away.  Should the fields issue not be resolved, the remaining games could be scheduled as away games with the cost being negligible – busing versus officials.  Mr. Rybak addressed the board on the status of the fields.  May 15 is deadline for seeding – Spring seeding will require a summer of watering due to the newness of the grass.  A combination of rye seed and bluegrass along with fertilizer will be used.  

· Levy Election Update:  Approval of budget is needed for the process of  the levy along with developing a series of budgets for future years in order to determine the dollar amount needed for the levy ballot.  Timeframe for the process and bringing a number to the board can be expected as early as the beginning days of June.  A board workshop may also need to be scheduled in order to come to the final number.  

· Committee Reports

· Executive Board:   Committee meetings consisted primarily of budget with discussion on areas that may be in need of adjustment.  Mr. Rouse was presented with  a contact to review.
· Strategic Leadership:      Three policies will be placed on the agenda for first reading and will be added to the next meeting action agenda for approval.  There are no changes to these policies.
· Review & Evaluation:   Budget was the primary concern of the committee meeting.  Construction update:  The auxiliary gym will become the same size as the main gym following construction.  There is a $115,000 bleacher cost for the new area along with a change order amounting to $8250 to modify the existing bleachers allowing for easier setup making the handrails compact with the bleachers as they are raised and lowered.  Installation of these bleachers will give New Prague a top notch facility able to hold tournaments and multiple games. A check has been received from insurance for the damage done to the Auxiliary Gym floor at the time of the water break. A relief cut was made into the main floor gym in order to assist in the settling of the floorboards.  A more thorough inspection will be conducted following graduation.

· MRVSEC:   Mr. Havlicek stated that during the last meeting of the Board of Directors a resolution passed to eliminate a coordinator position due to downsizing.  The first review of the calendar was given and the preliminary budget was presented which is significantly less due to the downsizing of the cooperative.   Teacher negotiation has also begun.
· Wind Power/Joint Power:   The next meeting will be on June 11.  Groundwork is in place to begin the process of acquiring land and moving forward.

· NSBA National Convention:  Don Dvorak attended the National Convention in San Francisco in mid April.   A lot of big money will be made available for sports, arts, wellness emphasizing better diets and exercise.  Booster clubs are going to be forced to be more accountable with the dollars they have and to spend the money, not hoarding the amounts in banks.  Advertising in schools is becoming a money making business for schools with a lot of monies available.  A process of moving administration to cover multiple school districts is in its beginning stages.  All day – every day kindergarten is getting a big push.  No Child Left Behind will be undergoing changes, perhaps drastically.  
· Dates to Note: Moved the executive committee meeting to Wednesday, May 9 at 7:00 pm.    Board Member Reed reminded board members to attend some of the extra curricular activities that happen at the end of the school year.
COMMITTEE TO RISE

Motion by Havlicek and seconded by Beckius for the committee to rise.  Motion carried 6/0.

ACCEPT COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATIONS

Mr. Mark Beltz presented a dental insurance option for the school district staff.  Immediate action is requested to approve entering into the Health Partners Dental Program.  Presentation was given on the budget and discussed the soccer program for next year.  Immediate action is requested to approve Budget 2007/2008.  Levy election update was conducted and subcommittee reports were heard along with MRVSEC and the NSBA convention reports.  Dates to Note were noted.  Motion by Havlicek and seconded by Dvorak to accept the committee report.  Motion carried 6/0.  

IMMEDATE ACTION  

Approval of 2007/2008 Budget:  Motion by Havlicek and second by Beckius to approve the 2007/2008 budget.  Motion carried 6/0.

Approve the participation in the Health Partners Dental Insurance Program:  Motion by Dvorak and seconded by Walerius to participate in the Health Partners Dental Insurance Program.  Motion carried 6/0.

Change order for construction on the High School Addition:  

Motion was made by Reed seconded by Beckius to approve the awarding of the contract to S.A.F.E.  Seating and Athletic Facilities Enterprises for universal bleachers for a cost of $115,681 and award an alternative bid to the same company the safety handrails on the current bleachers in the amount of $8,250.  Motion carried 6/0

ADJOURNMENT 
Motion by Havlicek and seconded by Beckius to adjourn the regular school board meeting at 7:35 pm

End of Meeting Minutes

Award Milk Bid - We request that the bid be awarded to Hastings Co-op creamery and that it will be the Escalting Bid
	2007 - 08 MILK BID COMPARISON
	Meyer Bros.
	Hastings 

	Firm Bid 1/2 pints
	 
	 

	 
	 
	 

	2%
	0.209
	No Bid

	Skim
	0.195
	No Bid

	Chocolate
	0.212
	No Bid

	Strawberry
	0.214
	No Bid

	Lactose-Free
	0.46
	0.47

	Cooler Rental
	No Charge
	No Charge

	Esc. Bid 1/2 pints
	 
	 

	2%
	0.179
	0.179

	Skim
	0.162
	0.164

	Chocolate
	0.182
	0.173

	Strawberry
	0.184
	0.178

	Lactose-Free
	0.44
	No Bid


Award Bread Bid – We request that the bid be awarded to Interstate Brand Company  
	Comparative
	
	IBC
	
	Sara Lee

	Item Description
	Specified Unit
	Unit Cost
	Specified Unit
	Unit Cost

	Whole Grain Wheat 
	18 Slices
	$0.95
	21 Slices
	$1.28

	Whole Grain White 
	18 Slices
	$1.10
	26 Slices
	$1.18

	Texas Toast 
	15 Slices
	$0.85
	17 Slices
	$1.26

	5" Hot Dog Buns
	12 / Pkg.
	$1.05
	16 / Pkg.
	$1.18

	3 3/4" Hamburger Buns
	12 / Pkg.
	$1.10
	12 / Pkg.
	$1.18

	Kaiser Buns
	12 / Pkg.
	$1.20
	12 / Pkg.
	$3.50


Personnel Items

· Administrative Recommendation
	Employment Hire Date:
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Name
	Position
	Hours
	Bldg
	Lane/

Step
	Salary
	Effective Date
	New/Replacement

	Biermaier, Jeremy
	Morning Ball Head Coach
	 
	CEC
	 
	$1,000 
	5/15/2007
	Mitch Comfort

	Coons, Mary Jo
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Dvorak, Julie
	Soccer Head Coach/Coordinator
	 
	CEC
	 
	$1,000 
	6/1/2007
	Carmen Bohlke

	Kari Dolezal
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Gerold, Jane
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Hopke, Jon
	JV Boys Soccer Coach
	 
	HS
	28 pts
	$3,360 
	5/8/2007
	New

	Jeno, Cathy
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Jirik, Marie
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Kehrli, Steve
	JV Girls Soccer Coach
	 
	HS
	28 pts
	$3,360 
	5/8/2007
	New

	Kriha, John
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Kriha, Sue
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Lukkes, Mary
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Palma, Kristen
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Rancour, Brenda
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Schoenecker, Molly
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Sticha, Marge
	ESY SPED Paraprofessional
	 
	CEC
	 
	 
	6/18/2007
	New

	Lane Changes: 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Solheid, Candice
	Kindergarten Teacher
	4
	EV
	2BA+10
	$15,741.09 
	5/11/2007
	 

	Steichen, Sarah
	PE/HE Teacher
	8
	MS
	4BA+10
	$32,417.46 
	5/9/2007
	 

	Van Roekel, Melodi
	Music Teacher
	8
	FR
	10BA+30
	$44,127 
	5/8/2007
	 

	Leaves:
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Dorick, Jeremy
	Industrial Education Teacher
	6.38
	HS
	5BA
	$27,428.18 
	5/10/2007
	Requests a leave of absence for the 2007-2008 school year

	Smith, Dana
	PE Teacher
	4
	FR
	11MA
	$24,377.50 
	8/28/2007
	Requests a continuation of a .5 part-time leave of absence for the 2007-2008 school year

	Miller, Deb
	Elementary Teacher
	
	
	
	
	
	Continuation of medical leave of absence

	Resignations: 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Lhotka, Scott
	Head Speech Coach
	 
	HS
	23 pts
	$2,760 
	5/16/2007
	1 year of service

	Neufeld, Lisa
	Speech Coach
	 
	MS
	15 pts
	$1,800 
	5/4/2007
	2 years of service

	Lambrecht, Vicki
	Transition Coordinator
	8
	HS
	1BA
	$31,311
	5/16/07
	1 year of service

	Odenthal, Terry
	Senior Class Advisor
	
	HS
	4 pts
	$480
	6/11/07
	


· Finance

· Accounts Payable Records
POST       POST           CHECK                      CHECK                       
MONTH      DATE          NUMBER VENDOR               DATE                  AMOUNT
May        05/03/2007    112822 ACADEMIC COMMUNICATI 05/03/2007              4.90

May        05/03/2007    112823 ALLTEL               05/03/2007            375.55

May        05/03/2007    112824 AMAZON CREDIT PLAN   05/03/2007            348.98

May        05/03/2007    112825 AMBROZ RITA M        05/03/2007            150.00

May        05/03/2007    112831 APPERT FOODS         05/03/2007         15,736.92

May        05/03/2007    112832 BATTERIES PLUS       05/03/2007            139.92

May        05/03/2007    112834 BIX FRUIT COMPANY    05/03/2007          2,561.90

May        05/03/2007    112835 BLASCHKO, LISA       05/03/2007             89.10

May        05/03/2007    112836 BRAUN, CATHERINE     05/03/2007            296.65

May        05/03/2007    112837 BROADWING TELECOMMUN 05/03/2007             42.10

May        05/03/2007    112838 BRODART COMPANY      05/03/2007            201.63

May        05/03/2007    112839 CAMERON, KRIS        05/03/2007            141.72

May        05/03/2007    112840 CEDAR LAKE ELECTRIC  05/03/2007            203.88

May        05/03/2007    112841 CIHAK, BARBARA       05/03/2007             20.00

May        05/03/2007    112842 COMCAST              05/03/2007            225.97

May        05/03/2007    112843 CORPORATE EXPRESS    05/03/2007          8,738.70

May        05/03/2007    112844 DECKER, JEFFREY      05/03/2007            120.00

May        05/03/2007    112845 DELL MARKETING LP    05/03/2007          1,924.01

May        05/03/2007    112846 DITTBERNER, TIM      05/03/2007             60.73

May        05/03/2007    112847 DOLEZAL, KARI        05/03/2007             17.46

May        05/03/2007    112848 DROMMERHAUSEN VALERI 05/03/2007            452.47

May        05/03/2007    112849 E RATE CONSULTING SE 05/03/2007          8,258.81

May        05/03/2007    112850 ECONO FOODS #317     05/03/2007             46.36

May        05/03/2007    112851 EMBROIDERY BY JANELL 05/03/2007             40.00

May        05/03/2007    112852 FREESTYLE SALES CO   05/03/2007             49.45

May        05/03/2007    112853 G & K SERVICES INC.  05/03/2007             60.73

May        05/03/2007    112854 GARDEN & ASSOCIATES, 05/03/2007            109.92

May        05/03/2007    112855 GOVCONNECTION        05/03/2007             98.13

May        05/03/2007    112856 GRAINGER WW INC      05/03/2007            240.40

May        05/03/2007    112857 GREATER MINNESOTA GA 05/03/2007          4,900.12

May        05/03/2007    112858 GROTH CHESTER E MUSI 05/03/2007             37.00

May        05/03/2007    112859 W.L. HALL COMPANY    05/03/2007          1,000.00

May        05/03/2007    112869 HAWKEYE FOOD DISTRIB 05/03/2007         11,207.92

May        05/03/2007    112870 HILLYARD INC         05/03/2007             17.61

May        05/03/2007    112871 HODGSON, JESSICA     05/03/2007             89.03

May        05/03/2007    112872 IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 05/03/2007          4,690.00

May        05/03/2007    112882 INDIANHEAD FOODSERVI 05/03/2007         20,549.91

May        05/03/2007    112883 INTEGRA TELECOM      05/03/2007          2,153.04

May        05/03/2007    112884 PETTY CASH           05/03/2007             25.46

May        05/03/2007    112885 ISD 721 ATHLETIC PRO 05/03/2007          4,497.00

May        05/03/2007    112886 KAVAN BARB           05/03/2007            566.28

May        05/03/2007    112887 LARSON, BILLI        05/03/2007             46.60

May        05/03/2007    112888 LESUEUR COUNTY TREAS 05/03/2007             50.00

May        05/03/2007    112889 LHOTKA, SCOTT        05/03/2007             32.83

May        05/03/2007    112890 LOFTNESS, JILL       05/03/2007            210.00

May        05/03/2007    112891 MAHOWALD MOTORS INC  05/03/2007             33.33

May        05/03/2007    112892 MARQUARDT JEWELERS   05/03/2007            339.00

May        05/03/2007    112893 ARCH WIRELESS/METROC 05/03/2007             20.92

May        05/03/2007    112894 MINNESOTA CLAY, U.S. 05/03/2007              8.95

May        05/03/2007    112895 MUELLER, SARAH       05/03/2007            833.91

May        05/03/2007    112896 NICKLASSON ATHLETIC  05/03/2007            537.10

May        05/03/2007    112897 NORTHFIELD LINES INC 05/03/2007            534.00

May        05/03/2007    112898 NSBA                 05/03/2007            800.00

May        05/03/2007    112899 TAMMY NYE            05/03/2007             99.67

May        05/03/2007    112900 O'MALLEY PATRICK K.  05/03/2007            119.72

May        05/03/2007    112903 OFFICE ETC           05/03/2007          1,096.47 

May        05/03/2007    112905 OTIS SPUNKMEYER INC  05/03/2007          4,457.26

May        05/03/2007    112906 PARKVIEW MEDICAL CLI 05/03/2007            183.00

May        05/03/2007    112907 PAULSEN, ERICA       05/03/2007             45.59

May        05/03/2007    112908 PEPSI COLA           05/03/2007          2,996.90

May        05/03/2007    112909 POMERENKE, JOHN      05/03/2007             89.10

May        05/03/2007    112910 PURCHASE POWER/PITNE 05/03/2007          3,130.00

May        05/03/2007    112911 REGION V COMPUTER SE 05/03/2007            100.00

May        05/03/2007    112912 ROCKLER WOODWORKING  05/03/2007             34.65

May        05/03/2007    112913 SAMUEL FRENCH, INC   05/03/2007             85.00

May        05/03/2007    112914 SAPP RITA K          05/03/2007             73.84

May        05/03/2007    112918 SARA LEE BAKERY GROU 05/03/2007            978.90

May        05/03/2007    112919 SCOTT COUNTY         05/03/2007         15,746.57

May        05/03/2007    112920 SNAP ON TOOLS CORP   05/03/2007          4,535.00

May        05/03/2007    112921 SOUTH CENTRAL SERVIC 05/03/2007          3,981.12

May        05/03/2007    112922 STATE SUPPLY CO      05/03/2007          1,548.91

May        05/03/2007    112924 SUEL PRINTING        05/03/2007          1,241.40

May        05/03/2007    112925 T-MOBILE             05/03/2007            839.59

May        05/03/2007    112926 TEACHING ON THE MOVE 05/03/2007            150.00

May        05/03/2007    112927 TRANS ALARM          05/03/2007             23.44

May        05/03/2007    112928 TRAINING ROOM INC    05/03/2007            537.78

May        05/03/2007    112929 TRETTEL GREG OR DIAN 05/03/2007            200.00

May        05/03/2007    112930 TRI-COUNTY BEVERAGE  05/03/2007             57.00

May        05/03/2007    112931 COLLEEN TURNER       05/03/2007            200.00

May        05/03/2007    112932 JOEL TURENSKY        05/03/2007            585.00

May        05/03/2007    112933 ULINE SHIPPING SUPPL 05/03/2007             19.07

May        05/03/2007    112934 UPS                  05/03/2007              9.48

May        05/03/2007    112935 WESTERN PSYCHOLOGICA 05/03/2007             84.70

May        05/03/2007    112936 YOUNGBLOOD LUMBER CO 05/03/2007          1,268.79

May        05/03/2007    112937 ZWEBER, BARBARA      05/03/2007             20.00

May        05/03/2007    112938 PELTZMAN, WILLIAM    05/03/2007            320.00

May        05/10/2007    112939 ALLTEL               05/10/2007             16.00

May        05/10/2007    112940 ALTA BOOK PUBLISHERS 05/10/2007             21.45

May        05/10/2007    112943 APPERT FOODS         05/10/2007          6,121.68

May        05/10/2007    112944 BARTUSEK, MICHAEL    05/10/2007             19.33

May        05/10/2007    112945 BELL, RICHARD        05/10/2007            101.12

May        05/10/2007    112946 BELLE PLAINE COOP    05/10/2007          2,997.00

May        05/10/2007    112947 BORGEN, NICOLE       05/10/2007             78.40

May        05/10/2007    112948 BRUCHMAN ELAINE      05/10/2007             31.96

May        05/10/2007    112949 BRUZEK, STEPHEN      05/10/2007             12.94

May        05/10/2007    112950 COUNCIL FOR EXCEPTIO 05/10/2007            175.00

May        05/10/2007    112951 CREEKS BEND GOLF COU 05/10/2007            482.00

May        05/10/2007    112952 CUMMINGS AUTO SALES  05/10/2007             84.50

May        05/10/2007    112953 DECKER, JEFFREY      05/10/2007            159.04

May        05/10/2007    112954 DESIGNER SPORTS      05/10/2007            838.00

May        05/10/2007    112955 DEVALK CARRIE        05/10/2007             93.50

May        05/10/2007    112956 DICK BLICK ART MATER 05/10/2007            353.34

May        05/10/2007    112957 NEW PRAGUE AREA SCHO 05/10/2007            181.47

May        05/10/2007    112958 DOYLE, ANNE          05/10/2007            232.80

May        05/10/2007    112959 DRAZENOVICH, SHARON  05/10/2007             78.38

May        05/10/2007    112960 DUOOS, MATTHEW       05/10/2007             31.14

May        05/10/2007    112961 BEVCOMM              05/10/2007          7,112.06

May        05/10/2007    112962 ECONO FOODS #317     05/10/2007             86.69

May        05/10/2007    112963 ECONO FOODS #317     05/10/2007             52.03

May        05/10/2007    112964 ECONO FOODS #317     05/10/2007            137.17

May        05/10/2007    112965 ECONO FOODS #317     05/10/2007            100.60

May        05/10/2007    112966 ECOLAB PEST ELIMINAT 05/10/2007            356.50 

May        05/10/2007    112967 GOODIN CO            05/10/2007             26.63

May        05/10/2007    112968 GRAINGER WW INC      05/10/2007            146.44

May        05/10/2007    112969 H & W EQUIPMENT      05/10/2007              8.91

May        05/10/2007    112970 HARCOURT ACHIEVE     05/10/2007            812.90

May        05/10/2007    112971 HILLYARD INC         05/10/2007            966.47

May        05/10/2007    112972 HOGLUND BUS & TRUCK  05/10/2007         23,884.55

May        05/10/2007    112973 IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 05/10/2007          1,298.98

May        05/10/2007    112974 BUILDING & TRANS. PE 05/10/2007            500.00

May        05/10/2007    112975 ISD 721 COMM ED PROG 05/10/2007            851.37

May        05/10/2007    112976 PETTY CASH/RAVENSTRE 05/10/2007            212.15

May        05/10/2007    112977 PETTY CASH           05/10/2007            318.14

May        05/10/2007    112978 ISD 721 NEW PRAGUE S 05/10/2007            506.25

May        05/10/2007    112978 ISD 721 NEW PRAGUE S 05/10/2007           -506.25

May        05/10/2007    112979 ISLEY, KIMBERLY      05/10/2007            223.10

May        05/10/2007    112980 JUFFER, PAULA        05/10/2007             49.47

May        05/10/2007    112981 KATIE KALINA         05/10/2007            154.00

May        05/10/2007    112982 KARLSBURGER FOODS IN 05/10/2007            304.20

May        05/10/2007    112983 KODELKA NANCY J.     05/10/2007            404.30

May        05/10/2007    112984 LAKERS NP SANITARY S 05/10/2007          4,197.63

May        05/10/2007    112985 WILLIAM V MACGILL &  05/10/2007            120.75

May        05/10/2007    112986 MALECHA CHERYL M     05/10/2007            229.13

May        05/10/2007    112987 MAPT                 05/10/2007             45.00

May        05/10/2007    112988 MASE                 05/10/2007            130.00

May        05/10/2007    112989 M A S S P            05/10/2007            470.00

May        05/10/2007    112990 MERZER, SHEILA       05/10/2007            100.00

May        05/10/2007    112991 MEYER BROS DAIRY INC 05/10/2007          8,029.40

May        05/10/2007    112992 NEW PRAGUE UTILITIES 05/10/2007         43,338.59

May        05/10/2007    112993 MVEC                 05/10/2007          3,537.25

May        05/10/2007    112994 NAEIR                05/10/2007            267.47

May        05/10/2007    112995 NEW PRAGUE AREA COMM 05/10/2007            165.00

May        05/10/2007    112996 NICKLASSON ATHLETIC  05/10/2007            150.00

May        05/10/2007    112997 NIEMAN ROOFING       05/10/2007            400.00

May        05/10/2007    112998 NOVOTNY, JARROD      05/10/2007             13.53

May        05/10/2007    113000 OFFICE ETC           05/10/2007          2,026.96

May        05/10/2007    113001 OWL BRAND DISCOVERY  05/10/2007            237.08

May        05/10/2007    113002 PIONEER REVERE       05/10/2007            104.00

May        05/10/2007    113003 BARB PRCHAL          05/10/2007            103.48

May        05/10/2007    113004 RE-RUNS              05/10/2007          1,774.00

May        05/10/2007    113006 RIVER VALLEY TRUCK C 05/10/2007          2,141.01

May        05/10/2007    113007 ROCHESTER MIDLAND    05/10/2007          1,744.42

May        05/10/2007    113008 SAM'S CLUB DISCOVER  05/10/2007          1,073.05

May        05/10/2007    113009 SAMS CLUB            05/10/2007             18.56

May        05/10/2007    113010 SBSI INC             05/10/2007            300.80

May        05/10/2007    113011 SCHOENECKER LAURA    05/10/2007            832.83

May        05/10/2007    113012 SCIENCE KIT & BOREAL 05/10/2007            512.96

May        05/10/2007    113013 SDE REGISTRATION     05/10/2007            927.00

May        05/10/2007    113014 SOUTH CENTRAL SERVIC 05/10/2007             25.00

May        05/10/2007    113015 STATE SUPPLY CO      05/10/2007            379.90

May        05/10/2007    113016 SUEL PRINTING        05/10/2007          2,721.28

May        05/10/2007    113017 TRA INFORMATION MANA 05/10/2007          1,375.00

May        05/10/2007    113018 TRANS ALARM          05/10/2007             89.31

May        05/10/2007    113019 TRI-COUNTY BEVERAGE  05/10/2007            318.95

May        05/10/2007    113023 TRIO SUPPLY COMPANY  05/10/2007          1,155.05

May        05/10/2007    113024 U S NETCOM CORPORATI 05/10/2007            197.50

May        05/10/2007    113025 VANDENBERG, AMY      05/10/2007             22.56

May        05/10/2007    113026 XCEL ENERGY/NORTHERN 05/10/2007          6,469.04 

May        05/10/2007    113027 DR STEPHEN SCHROEDER 05/10/2007          1,235.80

                                              Totals for checks        275,889.35 

